
 
Hello Lowell Families and community,  

It’s the final push before a much-needed winter break! Today, Friday, December 9th, Lundy 
6th grade students will be presenting their “Living Wax Museum” from 9-11:30am in the Study 
& Testing room at Lundy. Be sure to check it out!  
 
Friday, December 16, will be the Self-Manager assembly for Lundy kiddos! 
 
Unfortunately, LifeTouch was unable to complete picture retakes this week, so they have 
been rescheduled for January 10th. We will let you know when we have a code. 
 
Next week is Spirit week at Lundy: Monday is ugly sweater weather, Tuesday is mad about 
plaid, Wednesday is jingle bells, Thursday is candy cane and Friday is Christmas jammies! 
 
Spirit week at LHS is next week as well! Monday is Christmas morning (AKA PJ day!), Tuesday 
is flannel day, Wednesday is New Year’s Eve formal, Thursday is Christmas character and 
Friday is ugly sweater or Christmas spirit. 
 
Did you know that Santa’s Helpers are working at Lowell Jr/Sr High? If you have a gift that 
needs assembling, bring it on over to the shop our “helpers” will work their magic! If you have 
questions, send emails to ryarbrough@lowell.k12.or.us. 
 
Progress reports for LHS were mailed out last week. Be sure to check ParentVUE and 
StudentVue for updates and grade changes. If your student has outstanding or missing 
assignments, encourage them to get them turned in. Afterschool tutoring happens every 
day. If additional support is needed, encourage your student to stay for tutoring. 
 
December 12, 2022 is the Choir and Band Winter Concert at Lowell Jr/Sr High. The 
performance begins at 7:00pm in the Cafetorium. This is a lovely way to get into the holiday 
season and enjoy performances by very talented musicians.  
 
The winter sports season is in full swing! Tuesday, December 13, high school wrestling hosts a 
dual meet against Creswell and Oakridge starting at 5:00 in the Cafetorium. On the same 
night, High school Varsity basketball will play Yoncalla at home. Girls begin at 6:00pm and 
boys at 7:30pm in the main gym. Wednesday, December 14, junior high wrestling host a dual 
meet against Oaklea at 6:00pm in the Cafetorium. Thursday, December 14, high school 
basketball will travel to Gaston to play. JV girls begin at 3:00pm, JV boys at 4:30pm, Varsity 
girls at 6:00pm, and Varsity boys at 7:30pm. Saturday, December 17, high school wrestling is 
hosting a 15-team tournament. 
 
Stay safe, healthy, and kind! 
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